

**Great Rivers Greenway Bid Results for Landscape, Mowing and Park Maintenance in the Mississippi, St. Vincent, River des Peres
Greenways and Others As-Needed
10/15/2020, 3:30 PM CST**

Submitting Firm

	Natural Lawn and Landscaping	Ideal Landscape Group	TRC Outdoor	Shelton Landscape & Maintenance	Munie Greencare Professionals	DJM Ecological Services	Native Landscape Solutions	
Total*	\$1,134,000.00	\$810,034.00	\$850,565.00	\$651,300.00	\$281,005.00	\$783,365.00	\$691,609.00	
Estimated 2700 additional hours**	\$135,000.00	\$148,500.00	\$94,500.00	\$140,400.00	\$121,500.00	\$148,500.00	\$93,150.00	
City Arch River Areas	Leonore K.	\$114,000	\$66,775	\$28,500	\$34,900	no bid	\$45,000	\$40,255
	Kiener Plaza	\$75,000	\$91,230	\$104,600	\$74,600	no bid	\$74,090	\$40,560
	Mulching Kiener Plaza	\$5,000	\$14,636	\$8,000	\$14,800	\$11,800	\$18,500	\$3,400
	Washington & Memorial Avenue Planters	\$20,000	\$22,069	\$26,880	\$6,200	\$2,750	\$7,575	\$7,700
	Washington & Memorial Avenue Watering	\$300	\$850	\$1,200	\$860	included	\$480	\$130
	Walnut & Pine St. Walkway	\$10,000	\$9,636	\$1,200	\$2,200	no bid	\$3,220	\$4,992
	NPS East Slopes	\$60,000	\$70,941	\$195,000	\$176,000	\$139,045	\$112,050	\$134,810
	Additional Hourly	\$50.00	\$55.00	\$35.00	\$52.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	\$34.50
	Riverfront Trail	\$100,000	\$32,637	\$50,000	\$61,800	no bid	\$76,270	\$56,133
Katherin Ward Burg Garden	\$73,000	\$40,536	\$43,500	\$44,300	no bid	\$31,135	\$17,863	
RdP: Carondelet Connector	\$60,000	\$31,347	\$22,000	\$21,600	no bid	\$29,950	\$32,775	

	Natural Lawn and Landscaping	Ideal Landscape Group	TRC Outdoor	Shelton Landscape & Maintenance	Munie Greencare Professionals	DJM Ecological Services	Native Landscape Solutions	
Other Areas	St. Vincent: Forest Park to Etzel	\$26,000	\$27,798	\$24,000	\$22,500	no bid	\$8,887	\$25,608
	St. Vincent: Forest Park to Etzel Water	\$300	\$425	\$800	\$860	no bid	\$550	\$730
	St. Vincent: Trojan Park to Eskridge	\$35,000	\$15,744	\$24,000	no bid	no bid	\$19,574	\$20,988
	St. Vincent: Trojan Park to Eskridge Watering	\$400	\$425	\$1,200	no bid	no bid	\$750	\$720
	St. Vincent: St. Vincent County Park	no bid	\$13,817	\$24,000	no bid	no bid	\$6,874	\$8,000
	St. Vincent: Trojan Park to Etzel	\$65,000	\$18,990	\$42,500	no bid	no bid	\$25,400	\$27,150
	Mississippi: Cherrick lot	\$52,000	\$13,040	\$6,000	\$5,000	no bid	\$14,185	\$2,698
	Gravois: Phase 2 and Avenue I to Germania	\$61,000	\$28,757	\$60,000	\$32,400	no bid	\$32,350	\$28,200
	Gravois: Phase 2 and Avenue I to Germania Watering	\$300	\$850	\$1,200	\$1,720	no bid	\$850	\$720
	Fee Fee: Trail and Green Walls	\$22,000	\$55,004	\$56,000	no bid	no bid	\$39,350	\$15,860

		Natural Lawn and Landscaping	Ideal Landscape Group	TRC Outdoor	Shelton Landscape & Maintenance	Munie Greencare Professionals	DJM Ecological Services	Native Landscape Solutions
	Maline Greenway: Bellafontaine Park	\$35,000	\$20,008	\$36,000	no bid	no bid	\$19,150	\$18,720
	Maline Greenway: Bellafontaine Park Watering	\$300	\$850	\$1,200	no bid	no bid	\$2,000	\$720
	Additional Maintenance/hour	\$50.00	\$55.00	\$35.00	\$52.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	\$34.50
Conservation Areas	Dardenne: Bluebird Meadow	\$20,000	\$18,284	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$8,750	\$12,465
	Gravois: Hoffmeister & PH1&3	\$100,000	\$41,992	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$35,315	\$62,873
	Gravois: Phase 3 Watering	\$500	\$425	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$550	\$720
	St. Vincent County Park	\$18,000	\$5,740	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$9,000	\$9,360
	Meramec: Rock Alva	\$25,000	\$9,678	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$8,250	\$19,050
Mowing	Base Mowing	\$23,000	\$12,875	\$3,885	\$14,600	\$5,910	\$9,990	\$9,000
	Additional mowing/unit	50/ac	136/ac	65/ac	55/ac	45/ac	65/1000 sq ft	65/ac
Brush hog	hourly	\$200	\$55	\$65	\$52	\$80	\$60	\$55
	equip	\$0	\$350	20/hr	100/hr	90/hr	85/hr	25/hr
Chemical	hourly	\$150	\$48	\$45	\$52	\$75	\$55	\$65
	equip	\$0	\$0	10/hr	\$250	35/hr	10/hr	20/hr

		Natural Lawn and Landscaping	Ideal Landscape Group	TRC Outdoor	Shelton Landscape & Maintenance	Munie Greencare Professionals	DJM Ecological Services	Native Landscape Solutions
Site Prep	hourly	\$250	\$55	\$45	\$52	n/a	\$55	\$55
	equip	\$0	\$250	20/hr	100/hr	n/a	85/hr	25/hr
Brush Removal by hand	hourly	\$50	\$55	\$35	\$52	\$75	\$50	\$55
Brush - mechani- cal	hourly	\$200	\$55	\$35	\$52	\$95	\$60	\$55
	equip	\$0	\$50	10/hr	100/hr	155/hr	85/hr	30/hr
Tree removal	hourly	\$50	\$75	no bid	\$52	\$75	\$60	\$65
	equip	\$0	\$500	no bid	\$250	\$100	115/hr	30/hr
Native Seeding	hourly	\$50	\$55	no bid	\$52	no bid	\$55	\$65
	equip	\$0	\$50	no bid	TBD	no bid	85/hr	20/hr
Planting or	hourly	\$50	\$55	no bid	\$52	no bid	\$50	\$55
	equip	\$0	\$250	no bid	TBD	no bid	\$175	10/hr
Prescrib- ed	hourly	\$100	\$85	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$50	\$95
	equip	\$0	\$500	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2,400	40/hr

* Not all bids included pricing for all scopes of work. Totals do not include unit cost for watering.

** Bid requested hourly rate based on estimated 2700 hours of additional as-needed services over an annual contract.